KA / BG - GPO/ 2515 /WPP-47/ 2009 -2011

BRI ITN TSI
NJeR T

a3 - IV-A dotidecb, thdbeed, e NF, 20NN (fZea 9F, J& JIe NFAR) ~o. #8928

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION '

No. SAMVYASHAE 12 SHASANA 2011, Bangalore, Dated: 19.05.2011
Ordered that the translation of the BToFid® &*}5'3@55@?3 30n (STFWA) BEICDI, 2011
(20118 BDFE3% LRACHTD 2\103325: 12) in the English language, be published as authorised by the

Governor of Karnataka under clause (3) of Article 348 of the constitution of India in the Karnataka
Gazette for general information.

The following translation of the FToF 3% @%@“C)FS 30N (SWTIA) LQRICHI, 2011 (20118
BOOF LT WQACHI XoS: 12) in the English language is published in the Official Gazette under the
authority of the Governor of Karnataka under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India.
KARNATAKA ACT NO 12 OF 2011 :
(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the nineteenth day of March, 2011)
THE i{ARNATAKA VALUE ADDED TAX (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011
(Received the assent of the Governor on the séventeenth day of March, 2011)
An Act further to amend the Karnataka Value Added Tax Act, 2003.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Value Added Tax Act, 2003
(Karnataka Act 32 of 2004) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Sixty second year of the Republic of
[ndia, as follows.-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka Value Added
Tax ( Amendment) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force with effect from the first day of April, 2011.

2. Amendment of section 4.- [n the Karnataka Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (Karnataka Act 32
of 2004) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 4, in sub-section (1),-



2

(i) in clause (a), for sub-clause (ii), the following shall be substituted. namely:-
“(ii) Third Schedule, at the rate of five per cent, and " ;

(i) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:-
“(b) in respect of.-

(i) declared goods as specified in Section 14 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central
Act 74 of 1956) at the maximum rate specified for such goods under Section 15 of the
said Act;

(i) cigarettes, cigars, gutkha and other manufactured tobacco at the rate of fifteen per
cent;

(iii) other goods at the rate of fourteen per cent.”

3. Substitution of section 21- For section 21 of the principal Act, the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“21. Reimbursement of tax.- Tax collected under this Act on such class of purchases as may be
prescribed, made by specialised agencies of the United Nations Organisation, Multilateral Financial
Institutions and Organisations notified under the United Nations (Privileges and Immunities) Act,
1947 (Central Act 46 of 1947) and Consulates or Embassies of any other country but excluding
consulates or embassies as may be notified shall be reimbursed, in such manner and subject to
such conditions as may be prescribed.”

4. Amendment of section 25.- In section 25 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:- '

“Provided that the Commissioner may notify the website in which an application shall be
made electronically.”

5. Amendment of section 31.- In section 31 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words “sixty lakh rupees”, the words “one hundred lakh rupees”
shall be substituted;

(i) sub-section (6) shall be omitted.

6. Amendment of section 37.- In section 37 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the
words “one and a quarter per cent”, the words “one and one half per cent” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 40.- In section 40 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1),-

(a) in clause (a), for the words “five years”, the words “four years” shall be substituted;
(b) the following proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

“Provided that an assessment or re-assessment relating to any tax period ending 31" day of
March, 2007 shall be made within a period of five years after the end of the prescribed tax period.”

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “five years was a reference to ten years”, the words “four
years was a reference to eight years” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 53.- In section 53 of the principal Act, in sub-section (12), after
clause (a), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-



“Provided that in respect of any goods on which the rate of tax leviable is less than four per
cent, the penalty leviable under sub-clause (ii) shall be equivalent to five times the amount of tax
leviable.”

9. Amendment of section 54.- In section 54 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the Commissioner may notify the website in which the necessary information
shall be furnished by the driver or any other person-in-charge of the vehicle.”

10. Amendment of section 62.- In section 62 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4). in clause
(d), for the words “one hundred twenty days”, the words “two hundred forty days” shall be
substituted.

11. Amendment of the Second Schedule.- In the Second Schedule to the principal Act, the
entries relating to serial numbers 2 and 3 shall be omitted.

12. Amendment of the Third Schedule.- In the Third Schedule to the principal Act,

(i) in the entries relating to serial number 5, the words “used for cooking food" shall be omitted:
(ii) the entries relating to serial number 30 shall be omitted.
13. Amendment of the Sixth Schedule.- In the Sixth Schedule to the principal Act,-

(i) the entries relating to serial number 7, shall be omitted.

(i) in the entries relating to serial number 12, in column 3, for the words “Four per cent”, the
words “At the maximum rate specified for declared goods in section 15 of the Central Sales Tax Act,
1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956)" shall be substituted:

(iii) in the entries relating to serial number 23, in column 3, for the words “Thirteen and one half
per cent”, the words “Fourteen per cent” shall be substituted.

The above translation of the FToF&d® @Oﬁ@?&“ 3oR (SHTIB) LHEIDT, 2011 (2011T
FTOFUWT YOI 70&3: 12) be published in the Official Gazette under clause (3) of Article 348 of

the Constitution of India.

H.R. BHARDWAJ
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA

By order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka,
G.K. BOREGOWDA

Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs and Legislation

BHee® Bogmeocd, 3598 FoG FHuwwE, dordewd. (&3) (500 FITD)



